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Re: Ringshall Village Hall Car Park Repairs

1 message

info@frssurfacing.co.uk <info@frssurfacing.co.uk> Thu, Nov 10, 2022 at 10:18 AM
To: Ringshall Parish Clerk <pc.ringshall@gmail.com>

Hi we can repair all the joints on the car park for £3000 plus vat
We can completely resurface the main section of 28 x 32 for £8,500 plus vat
Or we can resurface the entire car park of 1,200m2 for £11,000 plus vat

Best regards
FRS SURFACING & DEMOLITION

WERB:

United Kingdom

Co. Reg. No.: 11009795 UTR No. 50 6402 2359
VAT Reg. No.: 294994334 SUBJECT TO VAT
CONTACT NUMBER:0330-3320-685

> On 9 Nov 2022, at 12:33 pm, Ringshall Parish Clerk < > wrote:
>
>

> Hi Bobby,
>

> Good to speak to you earlier. | have attached a birds eye view of our car park, so you can see the shape of it. In
terms of the dimensions, its 32m by 28 m in the main section of it - this does not include the area where the disabled
bays are or to the left of the semi circle island. Sorry its not the best picture, but hopefully you get a sense of it's
shape. | have attached pictures of the car park, including some of the seams so you can see the level of deterioration.
lts mainly the seams that are coming apart and need repairing.

>

> | look forward to hearing from you.

>

> Many thanks,

> Lacey

>
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